

Ogemaw County Road Commission
2019 Material & Services Bids Summary.xls

| CATEGORY/ VENDOR | Description #1 & Unit Price | Description #2 & Unit Price | Description #3 & Unit Price | Description #4 & Unit Price | Description #5 & Unit Price | Description #6 & Unit Price | Description #7 & Unit Price | Description #8 & Unit Price | Description #9 & Unit Price | Description #10 & Unit Price | Description #11 & Unit Price | Delivery Lead Time | Bid Firm For Days | Terms of Pmt & Discounts |
|--------------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|---------------------------------|---------------------------------|--|----------------------|--------------------------------|
| Asphalt Emulsions | HFRS2 OCRC | HFRS2 PLANT | AE-90 OCRC | AE-90 PLANT | | | | | | | | | | |
| BIT-MAT PRODUCTS | 2.30 | 2.10 | 2.40 | 2.20 | | | | | | | | DAY BEFORE | 365 | NET 30 |
| Bituminous Patching | Cold Patch | | Hot Mix | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | CP-5 (MS2S) | CP-6 (MSST) | 13A Mod | UPM | QPR | | | | | | | | | |
| PYRAMID PAVING | NO BID | NO BID | 50.00 | NO BID | | | | | | | | DAY BEFORE | 60 | NET 30 |
| ACE-SAGINAW PAVING | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | 88.50 | | | | | | | NA | 30 | NET 30 |
| UNIQUE PAVING MATERIALS | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | 89.00 | | | | | | | | 1 DAY | 365 | 30 |
| Blades - Grader & Scraper | 5/8 X 8 X 72 | 3/4x8x84 | 5/8x6x72 | 3/4x8x84 | | | | | | | | | | |
| WEAR PARTS & EQUIP | 63.78 | 108.10 | 88.10 | 121.95 | | | | | | | | 6 WKS AFTER ORDER BASED ON AVAILABILITY | 30 | NET 30 |
| MICHIGAN CAT | 53.69 | 74.65 | NO BID | NO BID | | | | | | | | | 300 | NET 30 |
| NORDIK BLADES | 63.93 | 88.58 | 71.28 | 101.63 | | | | | | | | 30-90 | 365 | NET 30 |
| HEIGHTS TRUCK EQUIP | 60.47 | 102.50 | 83.53 | 116.23 | | | | | | | | 5-6 WKS | 30 | NET 30 |
| WINTER EQUIP | 68.66 | 116.36 | 94.84 | 131.27 | | | | | | | | 5-6 WKS | 30 | NET 30 |
| ST. REGIS CULVERT | 63.84 | 100.80 | 88.74 | 137.48 | | | | | | | | 6-8 WKS | 60 | NET 30 |
| TRUCK & TRAILER | 63.27 | 110.76 | 86.63 | 144.36 | | | | | | | | 3 WKS MIN | 30 | |
| Equipment Rental | Grader w/Oper | Grader w/o Oper | Dozer w/Oper | Dozer w/o Oper | Scraper w/Oper | Scraper w/o Oper | Excavator w/Oper | Excavator w/o Oper | Backhoe w/Oper | Backhoe w/o Oper | | | | |
| WANGLER & SONS TRUCKING | | | 95/HR | 60/HR | | | 115/HR | 75/HR | | | | | | |
| MICHIGAN CAT | | | | 684/DAILY | | 1,184/DAILY | | 684/DAILY | | 280/DAILY | | 24 HRS 1-2 SUB TO AVAILABILITY | 365 | NET 30 |
| | | | | | | | | | | | | | 90 | NET 30 |
| Liquid Calcium Chloride | 26% Chloride-Solid | 26% Chloride-Spot | Storage at OCRC Facility | Spread Only-Continuous | Spread Only-Solid | | | | | | | | | |
| LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE SALES | NO BID | NO BID | 0.5390 | NO BID | NO BID | | | | | | | 1-2 DAYS | 10/31/19 | NET 30 |
| MICHIGAN CHLORIDE SALES | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | | | | | | | | | | | |
| EASTERN DUST CONTROL | 0.2500 | 0.3000 | 0.1800 | 0.0700 | 0.09 | | | | | | | | | |
| Processed Rd Gravel | 23A Per Ton | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| R.E. GLANCY | NO BID | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| CARRICK TRUCKING | NO BID | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| CRAWFORD SAND & GRAVEL | 6.10 | | | | | | | | | | | 10 BUSINESS DAYS | 90 | NET 30 |
| BUNTING SAND & GRAVEL | 6.65 | | | | | | | | | | | ANYTIME DURING BUSINESS HOURS | 12/31/2019 | NET 30 |
| Seed & Mulch | Per Acre | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| WEST BRANCH GREENHOUSE | 1,595.00 | | | | | | | | | | | 1-2 DAYS | 365 | NET 30 |

Ogemaw County Road Commission
2019 Material & Services Bids Summary.xls

| CATEGORY/ VENDOR | Description #1 & Unit Price | Description #2 & Unit Price | Description #3 & Unit Price | Description #4 & Unit Price | Description #5 & Unit Price | Description #6 & Unit Price | Description #7 & Unit Price | Description #8 & Unit Price | Description #9 & Unit Price | Description #10 & Unit Price | Description #11 & Unit Price | Delivery Lead Time | Bid Firm For Days | Terms of Pmt & Discounts | | | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------------|---------------------------------|---------------------------------|------------------------|--------------------------|----------------------------------|--------------------------|--------------------------|--------------------------|---|--------------------------|-------|----|--------|--------|
| Trucking Rental | Tandems | Tri-Axles | | Quads | | Leads | | Trains | | V-Bottom | | Double V-Bottom | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Maximum Cost/Gal | 2.00 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | 2.00 / 2.50 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | 2.51 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | 2.51 / 3.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | 3.01 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | 3.01 / 3.50 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | 3.51 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | 3.51 / 4.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| WANGLER & SONS TRUCKING | | 80.00 | | | 100.00 | | 125.00 | | 101.50 | | 125.00 | | 24 HRS | 365 | NET 30 | | | | | | | | |
| | | 82.00 | | | 102.00 | | 127.00 | | 104.50 | | 128.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | 84.00 | | | 105.00 | | 129.00 | | 106.50 | | 131.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | 86.00 | | | 108.00 | | 131.00 | | 109.50 | | 134.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Signs and Posts | Name Sign 9X24 | Name Sign 9X30 | | Name Sign 9X36 | | 30" Stop | | 30" B/Y Warning | | 36" B/Y Warning | | 18"X24" Chevron | | 12"x36" B/Y Bridge Portal | | 48"x24" B/Y Arrow | | 12'-3# U-Type Steel Painted Post | | | | | |
| | High Intensity - Flat | High Intensity - Flat | High Intensity Prismatic - Flat | High Intensity - Flat | High Intensity Prismatic - Flat | High Intensity | High Intensity Prismatic | High Intensity | High Intensity Prismatic | Jumbo Cap Bracket | Jumbo Cross Bracket | High Intensity | High Intensity Prismatic | High Intensity | High Intensity Prismatic | High Intensity | High Intensity Prismatic | High Intensity | High Intensity Prismatic | | | | |
| | High Intensity - Extruded | High Intensity - Extruded | High Intensity Prismatic - Extruded | High Intensity - Extruded | High Intensity Prismatic - Extruded | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| MICHIGAN HIGHWAY SIGNS | 20.00 | 25.00 / 25.00 | 30.00 / 30.00 | 30.00 / 30.00 | 35.00 / 35.00 | 45.00 / 45.00 | 45.00 / 45.00 | 60.00 / 60.00 | 60.00 / 60.00 | | | 85.00 / 85.00 | 27.00 / 27.00 | 27.00 / 27.00 | 27.00 / 27.00 | 27.00 / 27.00 | 72.00 / 72.00 | 72.00 / 72.00 | No Bid | 4 WKS | 90 | NET 30 | |
| | 25.00 | 30.00 / 30.00 | 35.00 / 35.00 | 35.00 / 35.00 | 35.00 / 35.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| DORNBOS SIGN | 22.16 | | 24.73 | | 27.23 | | 30.97 | | 32.31 | 11.45 / 11.45 | | 46.53 | | 15.51 | | 15.51 | | 41.36 | | 30.76 | 30 | 365 | NET 30 |
| | 28.04 | | 32.57 | | 36.06 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| MD SOLUTIONS | 24.00 | 30.00 / 30.00 | 36.00 / 36.00 | 29.00 / 29.00 | 31.00 / 31.00 | | | 9.00 / 9.00 | 45.00 / 45.00 | 15.00 / 15.00 | 15.00 / 15.00 | 15.00 / 15.00 | 40.00 / 40.00 | 40.00 / 40.00 | | | | | 28.10 | 30 | 90 | NET 30 | |
| | 26.00 | 32.00 / 32.00 | 38.00 / 38.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |